COUNTY OF LEAVENWORTH
2024.02.15 CHEMICAL BID OPENING
BID TABULATION - FINAL

LEAVENWORTH
DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC WORKS

COUNTY

Murrfield Farms Supply LC, Nutrien AG Solutions Heritage Landscape Supply SiteOne Notes SiteOne Landscape Co
McLouth, KS Goddard, KS McKinney, TX Lenexa, KS
Used their bid
Item Description Container Size | Bid Quantity (Gal.) Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total quantity, not ours Bid Price Total
2,4-D Low Vol Easter (4#) 2.5 Gal 540 $ 17.75 |$ 9,585.00 | $ 1590 |$ 8,586.00 [$ 18.09 | $ 9,768.60 216 $ 227.78 | $49,200.05
2,4-D Amine (4#) 2.5 Gal 2880 $ 12.49 |$ 35,971.20 |$ 12.12 |$ 34,905.60 |$ 12.42 |$ 35,769.60 1152 $ 31.35 | $36,115.20
Tordon 22K 1 Gal 384 $ 53.58 |$ 20,574.72 [$ 48.25 |$ 18,528.00 |$ 48.73 | $ 18,712.32 63.368| $24,333.31
Remedy Ultra 1 Gal 384 $ 60.65 |$ 23,289.60 | $ 58.75 [$ 22,560.00 NO BID NO BID 110.515| $42,437.76
Plateau 1Gal 10 $ 119.85 |$ 1,198.50 | $ 117.00 |$ 1,170.00 |$ 135.05 | $ 1,350.50 142.418| $1,424.18
Glyphosate 41% 2.5 Gal 2000 $ 13.95 |$ 27,900.00 | $ 13.96 |$ 27,920.00 | $ 14.85 | $ 29,700.00 800 43.619| $34,895.20
Pasture Gard HL 1 Gal 384 $ 112.00 |$ 43,008.00 | $ 97.30 [$ 37,363.20 NO BID NO BID NOBID| NOBID
Escort XP 80z 640 $ 2.15|% 1,376.00 $ 1.85|$% 1,184.00 |$ 1.78 | $ 1,139.20 80 40.544| $3,243.52
Terravue 1.1 Ibs 52.8 Ibs/316.80z |$ 92.80 |$ 4,899.84 |$ 104.00 |$ 5,491.20 |$ 104.00 | $ 5,491.20 NO BID| NO BID
MSO Concentrate 2.5 Gal 50 $ 12.95 | $ 647.50 | $ 14.92 |$ 746.00 |$ 14.36 | $ 718.00 19.988| $999.40
OUTRIDER 20 oz. 1000 oz $ 14.40 |$ 14,400.00 | $ 14.65 |$ 14,650.00 | $ 14.58 | $ 14,580.00 800 78.543| $62,834.40
Plainview 2.5 Gal 25 $ 298.00 |$ 7,450.00 |$ 295.68 |$ 7,392.00 |$ 295.68 | $ 7,392.00 NOBID| NOBID
TOTAL | $190,300.36 TOTAL| $180,496.00 TOTAL $124,621.42 TOTAL | $255,483.02

Leavenworth County Contractor (5% local preference, percentage difference from lowest bid)

5.288 percentage difference
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